
City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 1, 2021

Non-Local BuyBoard Non-Local
For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 

Enforcement Officers
GT Distributors, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation

6100013583 AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St.

Estimated Austin, Austin, Ruleville

Item Description Annual TX 78758 TX 78758 MS 38771

Quantity 800-252-8310 800-252-8310 662-756-2810

 ITEM # 1 -STANDARD AMMUNITION-SPEER BULLETS, PART 
#53955- TRAINING-LAWMAN, .40 S&W, .165GR.TMJ

1 Speer Bullet, Part # 53955 2272 No Bid 
Lawman, .40 S&W, 165gr. TMJ   
Manufacture Name:  Speer Speer  
Manufacturer Product Number:  53955 53955  
Vendor Part # CCI-53955 CCI-53955  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.28549 0.65479
Price Per Case $285.49 $654.79

 Price Total $648,633.28 $1,487,682.88
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

SUBSTITUTE AMMUNITION FOR:                                                                                                                                              
ITEM # 1A -SPEER BULLETS, PART# 53955- TRAINING-
LAWMAN, .40 S7W, 165 GR. TMJ  - *Preferred Grain weight  
.165-.185

1.1 Speer .180gr. Part # CCI53652 1
Lawman, .40 S&W, 165gr -.185gr TMJ  
Manufacture Name: Speer Speer No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  53652 53652  
Vendor Part # CCI-53652 CCI-53652  
Grain weight .180gr .180gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.33365 0.65479  
Price Per Case $333.65 $654.79
Price Total $333.65 $654.79
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

1.2 Speer .165gr. Part # 53955 1
Lawman, .40 S&W, 165gr -.185gr TMJ  
Manufacture Name: Speer Speer No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  53955 53955  
Vendor Part # CCI-53955 CCI-53955  
Grain weight .165 gr .165 gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.28549 0.65479  
Price Per Case $285.49 $654.79
Price Total $285.49 $654.79
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

1.3 Federal .180gr,  Part # FC-AE40R1 1
American Eagle, .40 S&W, 165gr -.185gr TMJ  
Manufacture Name: Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  AE40R1 AE40R1  
Vendor Part # FC-AE40R1 FC-AE40R1  
Grain weight .180gr .180gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.34396 0.64726  
Price Per Case $343.96 $647.26
Price Total $343.96 $647.26
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

1.4 Federal .165gr,  Part # FC-AE40R1 1
American Eagle, .40 S&W, 165gr -.185gr TMJ  
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  AE40R1 AE40R3  
Vendor Part # FC-AE40R1 FC-AE40R3  
Grain weight .165gr .165gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.34396 0.64726  
Price Per Case $343.96 $647.26
Price Total $343.96 $647.26
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days



City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 1, 2021
Non-Local BuyBoard Non-Local

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers

GT Distributors, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation

6100013583 AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St.
Estimated Austin, Austin, Ruleville

Item Description Annual TX 78758 TX 78758 MS 38771
Quantity 800-252-8310 800-252-8310 662-756-2810

1.5 Hornady .175gr,  Part #  91374 1
FMJ Training Base .165gr -.185gr  
Manufacture Name: Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  91374 91374  
Vendor Part # 91374 91374  
Grain weight .175gr .175gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.56114 0.66406  
Price Per Case $561.14 $664.06
Price Total $561.14 $664.06
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

1.6 Hornady .165gr,  Part #  91375 1
FMJ Training Base .165gr -.185gr  
Manufacture Name:  Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  91375 91375  
Vendor Part # 91375 91375  
Grain weight .175gr .175gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.63171 0.51437  
Price Per Case $631.71 $514.37
Price Total $631.71 $514.37
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

1.7 Winchester .180gr, Part # WC402 1
Super X .165gr -.185gr  
Manufacture Name:  No Bid No Bid Winchester 
Manufacturer Product Number:     WC402
Vendor Part #   Winchester WC402
Grain weight   .180 gr
Rounds Per Case   1000
Price Per Round   0.284
Price Per Case $284.00
Price Total $284.00
Lead Time In Days 365 Days

1.8 Winchester .165gr, Part # WC401 1
Super X .165gr -.185gr  
Manufacture Name:  No Bid No Bid Winchester 
Manufacturer Product Number:     WC401
Vendor Part #   Winchester WC401
Grain weight   .165gr
Rounds Per Case   1000
Price Per Round   0.289
Price Per Case $289.00
Price Total $289.00
Lead Time In Days   365 Days

1.9 Remington, .180gr, Part # RA-L40SW3 1

UMC .165gr -.185gr  
Manufacture Name: Remington No  Bid No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  23742  
Vendor Part # 23742  
Grain weight .180gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000  
Price Per Round 0.38982  
Price Per Case $389.82
Price Total $389.82
Lead Time In Days 365 Days  



City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 1, 2021

Non-Local BuyBoard Non-Local
For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 
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GT Distributors, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation

6100013583 AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St.
Estimated Austin, Austin, Ruleville

Item Description Annual TX 78758 TX 78758 MS 38771
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1.10 Remington, .165gr, Part # L40SW423746 1
UMC .165gr -.185gr  
Manufacture Name: Remington No Bid No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  L40SW23746  
Vendor Part # 23746  
Grain weight .165gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000  
Price Per Round 0.38982  
Price Per Case $389.82
Price Total $389.82
Lead Time In Days 365 Days

1.11 Deleted 

1.12 Deleted 

1.13 Deleted

1.14 Deleted 



City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 1, 2021

Non-Local BuyBoard Non-Local
For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 

Enforcement Officers
GT Distributors, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation

6100013583 AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St.

Estimated Austin, Austin, Ruleville
Item Description Annual TX 78758 TX 78758 MS 38771

Quantity 800-252-8310 800-252-8310 662-756-2810

1.15 Speer, CCI .180gr, Part # CCI 5220 1
Blazer, Any grain weight .168gr-.185gr  
Manufacture Name: Speer Speer No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  CCI-5220 CCI-5220  
Vendor Part # 5220 5220  
Grain weight .180gr .180gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.3302 0.60613  
Price Per Case $330.20 $606.13
Price Total $330.20 $606.13
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

1.16 Speer, CCI .165gr, Part # CCI-5210 1
Blazer, Any grain weight .168gr-.185gr  
Manufacture Name: Speer Speer No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:   CCI-5210  CCI-5210  
Vendor Part # 23742 23742  
Grain weight .180gr .180gr  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.3302 0.60613  
Price Per Case $330.20 $606.13
Price Total $330.20 $606.13
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

ITEM # 2 - STANDARD AMMUNITION-SPEER BULLETS, PART 
# 53970-LE GOLD DOT DUTY, .40 S&W, .165GR. GDHP

2 Speer Bullet, Part # 53970 285   No Bid 
.40 S&W, .165gr GDHP  
Manufacture Name: Speer Speer  
Manufacturer Product Number:  53970 53970  
Vendor Part # CCI-53970 CCI-53970  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.45048 0.98841  
Price Per Case $450.48 $988.41
Price Total $128,386.80 $281,696.85
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

  
SUBSTITUTE AMMUNITION FOR:  ITEM # 2A -SPEER 
BULLETS, PART# 53970-LE GOLD DOT DUTY, .40 S&W, 
165GR. GDHP

2.1 Hornady, 91375  1   
.40 Caliber, .175gr, Critical Duty, Flex Lock  
Manufacture Name: Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  91375 91375  
Vendor Part # 91375 91375  
Grain weight 0.175 0.175  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.63171 0.51437  
Price Per Case $631.71 $514.37
Price Total $631.71 $514.37
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

2.2 Winchester, Part # RA40BA 1   
.40 Caliber, .165grDefender Ranger Bonded  
Manufacture Name: No Bid No Bid Winchester
Manufacturer Product Number:    RA40BA
Vendor Part #   Winchester RA40BA
Grain weight   .165gr
Rounds Per Case 1000
Price Per Round   0.399
Price Per Case $399.00
Price Total $399.00
Lead Time In Days  72 Days
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2.3 Federal, Part # P40HS3G 1  
.40 Caliber, .165gr Hydra-shok  
Manufacture Name: Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  P40HS3G P40HS3G  
Vendor Part # P40HS3G P40HS3G  
Grain weight No response No response  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.46913 0.97161  
Price Per Case $469.13 $971.61
Price Total $469.13 $971.61
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

2.4 Remington, Part # HD40SWA28957 1  
.40 Caliber, .165gr UMC, Ultimate Defense Handgun  
Manufacture Name: Remington No Bid No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  28957  
Vendor Part # 28957  
Grain weight No response  
Rounds Per Case 1000  
Price Per Round 1.13739  
Price Per Case $1,137.39
Price Total $1,137.39
Lead Time In Days 365 Days

ITEM # 3-20: STANDARD AMMUNITION
3 Speer Bullet, Part # 53375 3   

.40 S&W, .125gr, RHT Frangible  
Manufacture Name: Speer Speer No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  53375 53375  
Vendor Part# CCI-53375 CCI-53375  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.53385 1.0081  
Price Per Case $533.85 $1,008.10  
Price Total $1,601.55 $3,024.30  
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

4 Speer Bullet, Part # 53650 15  
9mm Luger, Lawman, .115gr. TMJ  
Manufacture Name: Speer No Bid No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  53650  
Vendor Part# CCI-53650  
Rounds Per Case 1000  
Price Per Round 0.26506  
Price Per Case $265.06  
Price Total $3,975.90  
Lead Time In Days 365 Days

5 Speer Bullet, Part # 53617 5   
9mm Luger +P, .124gr. GDHP, LE Gold Dot Duty  
Manufacture Name: Speer Speer No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  53617 53617  
Vendor Part# CCI-53617 CCI-53617  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days  
Price Per Round 0.39945 0.91021  
Price Per Case $399.45 $910.21  
Price Total $1,997.25 $4,551.05
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days
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6 Speer Bullet, Part # 53720 1  
38 Special +P, .125gr. GDHP, LE Gold Dot Duty  
Manufacture Name:  Speer Speer No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  53720 53720  
Vendor Part# CCI-53720 CCI-53720  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.47412 0.91021  
Price Per Case $474.12 $910.21  
Price Total $474.12 $910.21
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

7 Federal, Part # T223A 248
Tactical Tru, .223 Rem, 55gr., Hi Shok  
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  T223A T223A  
Vendor Part# FC-T223A FC-T223A  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.5351 1.27858  
Price Per Case $535.10 $1,278.58
Price Total $132,704.80 $317,087.84
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

8 Federal, Part # AE223 1458   
American Eagle, .223 Rem 55gr., FMJ  
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  AE223 AE223  
Vendor Part# FC-AE223 FC-AE223  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.43398 0.86808  
Price Per Case $433.98 $868.08
Price Total $632,742.84 $1,265,660.64
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

9 Federal, Part # BC223NT5A  (Discontinued) 4   
RTH .223 Rem. ,55gr. RHT (Frangible)  Alternate  Part # Alternate  Part #
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:   FC-BC556NX1; 50gr  FC-BC556NX1; 50gr  
Vendor Part#  FC-BC556NX1  FC-BC556NX1  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.67695 1.94684  
Price Per Case $676.95 $1,946.84
Price Total $2,707.80 $7,787.36
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

10 Federal, Part # GM308M 15   
Gold Medal, .308 Win. 168gr. , Sierra MatchKing BTHP  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal  
Manufacturer Product Number:  GM308M GM308M  
Vendor Part# FC-GM308M FC-GM308M  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 1.11372 2.1539
Price Per Case $1,113.72 $2,153.90
Price Total $16,705.80 $32,308.50
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days
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11 Federal, Part # LE12700 672  
Tactical Buckshot ,12ga. ,00 Buck (9 pellets)  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal  
Manufacturer Product Number:  LE12700 LE12700  
Vendor Part# FC-LE12700 FC-LE12700  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.70683 1.24238
Price Per Case $706.83 $1,242.38
Price Total $474,989.76 $834,879.36
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

12 Federal, Part # LEB127 RS 155   
Tactical TruBall Rifled Slug, 12ga., 1oz. Rifled Slug  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal  
Manufacturer Product Number:  LEB127RS LEB127RS  
Vendor Part# FC-LEB127RS FC-LEB127RS  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.73171 1.34664
Price Per Case $731.71 $1,346.64
Price Total $113,415.05 $208,729.20
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

13 Federal, Part # T116 7.5  3  
Birdshot, 12ga., 7.5 Birdshot  No Bid No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Federal  
Manufacturer Product Number:  T116 7.5  
Vendor Part# FC-T116-7.5  
Rounds Per Case 1000  
Price Per Round 0.41287
Price Per Case $412.87
Price Total $1,238.61
Lead Time In Days 365 Days

14 Defense Technology, Part # DT-3027 30,000
Drag Stabilized Bean Bag, 12ga. 40 gram  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology  
Manufacturer Product Number:  DT-3027 DT-3027  
Vendor Part# DT-3027 DT-3027  
Rounds Per Pack 5 Each 5 Each  
Price Per Round $6.36 $5.37
Price Total $190,800.00 $161,100.00
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

15 Defense Technology, Part # DT-3105 4   
TKO Breaching, 12ga.  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology  
Manufacturer Product Number:  3105 TKO 3105 TKO  
Vendor Part# DT-3105 DT-3105  
Price Per Round $5.59 $5.45  
Price Per Each  $7.57 $5.45
Price Total $30.28 $21.80
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

16 Force on Force, Part # FF9R2 19
Simunition 9mm FOF Marker Round Red  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Force on Force Force on Force  
Manufacturer Product Number:  FF9R2 FF9R2  
Vendor Part# FOF-FF9R2 FOF-FF9R2  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.69891 0.38665
Price Per Case $698.91 $386.65
Price Total $13,279.29 $7,346.35
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days
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17 Force on Force, Part # FF9B2 20
Simunition 9mm FOF Marker Round Blue   No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Force on Force Force on Force  
Manufacturer Product Number:  FF9B2 FF9B2  
Vendor Part# FOF-FF9B2 FOF-FF9B2  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.69891 0.38665
Price Per Case $698.91 $386.65
Price Total $13,978.20 $7,733.00
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

18 Deleted 

19 Force on Force, Part # FF556R1 3
Simunition 5.6mm, FOF Marker Round Red  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Force on Force Force on Force  
Manufacturer Product Number:  FF556R1 FF556R1  
Vendor Part# FOF-FF556R1 FOF-FF556R1  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.792889 0.44604
Price Per Case $792.89 $446.04
Price Total $2,378.67 $1,338.12
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

20 Force on Force, Part # FF556B1 3
Simunition 5.6mm, FOF Marker Round Blue  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Force on Force Force on Force  
Manufacturer Product Number:  FF556B1 FF556B1  
Vendor Part# FOF-FF556B1 FOF-FF556B1  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.79289 0.44604
Price Per Case $792.89 $446.04
Price Total $2,378.67 $1,338.12
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

Sub-Total (Items 1-20) $2,388,862.85 $4,629,942.35

Warranty Item #s 1-20 1-5 Years 1-5 Years 1 Year

ITEM # 21-38: SPECIALTY AMMUNITION FOR SWAT 
21 Defense Technology, Part # DT-8902NR 100

Low Roll Distraction Device Non-Reloadable-15gram  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology  
Manufacturer Product Number:  8902NR 8902NR  
Vendor Part# DT-8902NR DT-8902NR  
Rounds Per Box 1 1  
Price Per Round $69.86 $54.67
Price Per Each $69.86 $54.67

 Price Total $6,986.00 $5,467.00
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days
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22 Defense Technology, Part # DT-1292 50
Ferret 40mm Powder Barricade Round, CS, Barricade 
Penetrating, Projectile Powder-44mm

 

Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  2292 2292  
Vendor Part# DT-2292 DT-2292  
Rounds Per Box 1 1  
Price Per Round $27.07 $25.70  
Price Per Each $27.07 $25.70
Price Total $1,353.50 $1,285.00
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

23 Defense Technology, Part # DT-6325LE 50   
eXact iMpact 40mm Sponge Round Extend-44mm  
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  6325LE 6325LE  
Vendor Part# DT-6325LE DT-6325LE  
Rounds Per Box 1 1  
Price Per Round $28.71 $29.26  
Price Per Each $28.71 $29.26
Price Total $1,435.50 $1,463.00
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

  
24 Defense Technology, Part # DT-1032 100   

Flameless Tri-Chamber CS,Smoke, Grenades  
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  1032 1032  
Vendor Part# DT-1032 DT-1032  
Rounds Per Box 1 1  
Price Per Round $45.29 $38.17  
Price Per Each $45.29 $38.17
Price Total $4,529.00 $3,817.00
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

25 Defense Technology, Part # DT-1050 20   
Aerosol Grenades OC/CS  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology  
Manufacturer Product Number:  1050 1050  
Vendor Part# DT-1050 DT-1050  
Rounds Per Box 1 1  
Price Per Round $66.43 $49.64
Price Per Each $66.43 $49.64
Price Total $1,328.60 $992.80
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

26 Defense Technology, Part # DT-1192 100   
Ferret 37 mm Powder Barricade Round, CS-37 mm  No Bid 
Manufacture Name: Defense Technology Defense Technology  
Manufacturer Product Number:  1192 1192  
Vendor Part# DT-1192 DT-1192  
Rounds Per Box 1 1  
Price Per Round $26.29 $23.66
Price Per Each $26.29 $23.66
Price Total $2,629.00 $2,366.00
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

27 Defense Technology, Part # DT-1176 5
Model 20W Wood Baton Rounds-37mm  No Bid 
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology  
Manufacturer Product Number:  1176 1176  
Vendor Part# DT-1176 DT-1176  
Rounds Per Box 1 1  
Price Per Round $18.57 $18.53
Price Per Each $18.57 $18.53
Price Total $92.85 $92.65
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days
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28 Defense Technology, Part # DT-6530 1   
Def Tech 40mm Reloadable 250-shot training kit
Manufacture Name:  Defense Technology Defense Technology No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  DT-6530 DT-6530  
Vendor Part# DT-6530 DT-6530  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 1.34407 1.11117  
Price Per Kit $1,344.07 $1,111.17
Price Total $1,344.07 $1,111.17
Lead Time In Days 120 Days 120 Days

29 Hornady, Part # 80896 2   
Hornady TA, .308 Win, Urban Precision-110 gr.  
Manufacture Name:  Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  80896 80896  
Vendor Part# Hornady-80896 Hornady-80896  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 1.50071 1.22191  
Price Per Case $1,500.71 $1,221.91
Price Total $3,001.42 $2,443.82
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

30 Hornady, Part # 80725 2   
.308 Win 168gr. ELD Match Tap  
Manufacture Name:  Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  80725 80725  
Vendor Part# Hornady-80725 Hornady-80725  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 1.50071 1.22191  
Price Per Case $1,500.71 $1,221.91
Price Total $3,001.42 $2,443.82
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

31 Hornady, Part # 90225 2   
9mm Luger+P, 135gr. Flex Lock  
Manufacture Name:  Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  90225 90225  
Vendor Part# Hornady-90225 Hornady-90225  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 1.57929 0.51437  
Price Per Case $1,579.29 $514.37
Price Total $3,158.58 $1,028.74
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

32 Hornady, Part # 9760-LE-BX (Discontinued) 3   
Hornady - Lacquered Training Ammunition, .223 REM, .75gr  
Manufacture Name:  Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  FR320 5.56 .75gr FR320 5.56 .75gr  
Vendor Part # Hornady-FR320 Hornady-FR320  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.73429 0.5953  
Price Per Case $734.29 $595.30
Price Total $2,202.87 $1,785.90
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

33 Hornady, Part # 81292-BX 3   
Hornady-5.56 NATO Training TAP SBR, .75gr  
Manufacture Name:  Hornady Hornady No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  81292-BX 81292-BX  
Vendor Part# Hornady-81292-BX Hornady-81292-BX  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 0.68514 0.55802  
Price Per Case $685.14 $558.02
Price Total $2,055.42 $1,674.06
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days



City of San Antonio  
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 1, 2021
Non-Local BuyBoard Non-Local

For: Annual Contract For Ammunition For SAPD And Other Law 
Enforcement Officers

GT Distributors, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corporation

6100013583 AAS 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 2545 Brockton Dr. Suite 100 205 Floyce St.
Estimated Austin, Austin, Ruleville

Item Description Annual TX 78758 TX 78758 MS 38771
Quantity 800-252-8310 800-252-8310 662-756-2810

34 Federal, Part # GM308M2 1   
Gold Medal, Sierra MatchKing BTHP, .308 Win., .175gr  
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  GM308M2 GM308M2  
Vendor Part# FC-GM308M2 FC-GM308M2  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 1.16976 0.86156  
Price Per Case $1,169.76 $861.56  
Price Total $1,169.76 $861.56
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

35 Federal, Part # FC-LE308TT2 2   
Federal Cartridge, .308 Win,.168gr Tactical  
Manufacture Name:  Federal Federal No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  LE308TT2 LE308TT2  
Vendor Part# FC-LE308TT2 FC-LE308TT2  
Rounds Per Case 1000 1000  
Price Per Round 1.76085 1.39732  
Price Per Case $1,760.85 $1,397.32
Price Total $3,521.70 $2,794.64
Lead Time In Days 365 Days 365 Days

36 Pepperball Non-Lethal, Part # PBT-104-81-0375 5   
Pepperball Live-X Pava (OC) Round Powder Round Projectiles. 
.68gr, 3 grams

 

Manufacture Name:  Pepperball Pepperball No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  PBT-104-81-0375 PBT-104-81-0375  
Vendor Part# PBT-104-81-0375 PBT-104-81-0375  
Rounds Per Case 375 375  
Price Per Round 3.10856 2.952106667  
Price Per Case $1,165.71 $1,107.04
Price Total $5,828.55 $5,535.20
Lead Time In Days 180 Days 180 Days

37 Pepperball Non-Lethal, Part # 100-84-0375 5   
PBT Pepperball Inert 375 Count, .68gr, 3 grams  

Manufacture Name:  Pepperball Pepperball No Bid 
Manufacturer Product Number:  100-84-0375 100-84-0375  
Vendor Part# PBT-100-84-0375 PBT-100-84-0375  
Rounds Per Case 375 375  
Price Per Round 0.81907 0.77059  
Price Per Case $307.15 $288.97
Price Total $1,535.75 $1,444.85
Lead Time In Days 180 Days 180 Days

38 Deleted   

Warranty - Item #s 1-38 1-5 Years 1-5 Years N/A

Shelf Life 5 Years 5 Years N/A

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Sub-Total (Items 21-38) $45,173.99 $36,607.21 $972.00

Estimated Annual Total $2,434,036.84 $4,666,549.56 $972.00
Estimated Annual Award $2,165,923.82 $215,050.34 $972.00

Deleted Items: 1.11 - 1.14 and 18 will be re-bid at a later date. 
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